
THE LONG AWAITED! 
2021 Michigan Mechanical Code

Significant Changes

1



Thank you to SMACNA Board of 
Directors helping us share this 

important information

2



Also, we want to thank
• Walsh Community College, Ino-Tek

• Mark Charlene and Rich, Sue, Ed Bartram

• Michael Bergstrom of Thornton and Grooms

• All our membership who help develop and support 
these programs on a daily basis

3



About Code Consultant
Kendall Nightlinger

4



About us…
Founded in 1996, Ino-Tek is the Leader for the Design, 
Installation and Service of Turn-Key, Code-Compliant Life Safety 
/ Hazardous Material Emergency Alarm Systems and Gas 
Detection. Our customers include leading manufacturers, 
universities, research institutions, hospitals, municipalities, the 
United States Environmental Protection Agency and now - with 
changes in Michigan law legalizing marijuana for recreational use 
- grow, extraction and processing facilities across the state.

Ino-Tek has installed over 2200 Life Safety Systems that keep 
over 100,000 employees and visitors safe from exposure to toxic 
and flammable hazards. Keeping people and facilities safe around 
hazardous materials is our mission… and we do it better than 
anyone.  Across the United States, Canada and Mexico, Ino-Tek is 
the supplier of choice when it comes to keeping people and 
facilities safe around hazardous materials!

www.ino-tek.com
586-336-0856



Our Mission

Support the leading inspector education in 
Michigan to foster an advanced professional 

workforce

6



MMC 2021 
Significant Changes

3 Credit Hours 
1-A & R, 2-T  (MI)

7



2021 Michigan Mechanical Code
Effective March 12, 2024

Incorporates the 3rd printing of the 2021 
International Mechanical Code (IMC) as 
amended by MI Dept. of Licensing Affairs 
Construction Code, Part 9A

8



The Part 9A.

Mechanical Code rules was filed with the 
Secretary of State November 13, 2023, and 
become effective on March 12, 2024. 

The Part 9A Mechanical Code rules will adopt by 
reference the 2021 third printing edition of the 
International Mechanical Code with 
 amendments, 
 deletions, and 
 additions deemed appropriate for use in 

Michigan.
9



The Michigan Mechanical Code
was not yet printed

Until the electronic and hard copies are available 
from the International Code Council (ICC), one 
can use the 2021 International Mechanical Code 
with the Part 9A Michigan Amendments for the 
2021 Michigan Mechanical Code. 
The bureau will notify the public when the 
electronic and hard copy versions of each code 
are available for purchase and update the code 
books information on our website, which links to 
ICC for purchase. 

10



Codes are legally enforceable 
requirements
Generally, standards such as: NFPA,ACCA, ASHRAE, ASTM, 
NFPA, SMACNA, etc.) are industry consensus guidelines and 
recommendations.

However: The MMC states:
102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and 
standards referenced herein shall be those that are listed in 
Chapter 15 and such codes and standards shall be 
considered as part of the requirements of this code to the 
prescribed extent of each such reference and as further 
regulated in Sections 102.8.1 and 102.8.2. 

11



MMC 102.8.1 Conflicts

• Where conflicts occur between provisions of this 
code and the referenced standards, the 
provisions of this code shall apply. 

• 102.8.2 Provisions in referenced codes and 
standards. Where the extent of the reference to a 
referenced code or standard includes subject 
matter that is within the scope of this code, the 
provisions of this code, as applicable, shall take 
precedence over the provisions in the referenced 
code or standard. 

12



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Introduction

After completing this course, attendants will 
understand the significant changes between the 
2015 MMC and the 2021 MMC and gain practical 
knowledge for compliance and application in real 
world projects.

13



The majority of changes are due to

• Changes in technology

• Energy codes

• New materials 

• New methods

• Environmental factors

14



2021 MMC Significant Changes

Chapter 1 Scope and Administration……………………………………………………….. 30 min

Chapter 2 Definitions………………………………………………………………………………… 10 min

Chapter 3 General Regulations.………………………………………………………………….. 10 min

Chapter 4 Ventilation………………….…………………………………………………………….. 15 Min

Chapter 5 Exhaust Systems……………………………………………………………………….. 20 Min

Chapter 9 Specific Appliances, Fireplaces, and Solid Fuel-Burning Equipment….. 15 Min

Chapter 10 Boilers, Water Heaters and Pressure Vessels…………………………………. 10 Min

Chapter 11 Refrigeration……………………………………………………………………………… 40 Min

Chapter 15 Referenced Standards………………………………………………………………… 10 Min

Chapter 16 Automatic Sprinkler Systems Generally…………………………………………. 10 Min

Chapter 17 Process Piping…………………………………………………………………………… 10 Min

15

Overview



Chapter 1 Scope and Administration Section 101 General
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 

[A] 101.2 Scope. This code regulates the 
design, installation, maintenance, 
alteration and inspection of mechanical 
systems that are permanently installed 
and utilized to provide control of 
environmental conditions and related 
processes within buildings. This code 
shall also regulate the mechanical 
systems, system components, 
equipment and appliances specifically 
addressed in this code.

Exceptions:

Mechanical systems within 1- and 2-
family dwellings shall be constructed 
and maintained in accordance with the 
Michigan mechanical code for 1- and 2- 
family dwellings.

Mechanical systems in existing 
buildings undergoing repairs, 
alterations, or additions, and change of 
occupancy shall be permitted to 
comply with the Michigan rehabilitation 
code for existing buildings.

R 408.30902a 

[A] 101.2 Scope. This code shall 
regulate the design, installation, 
maintenance, alteration and inspection 
of mechanical systems that are 
permanently installed and utilized to 
provide control of environmental 
conditions and related processes within 
buildings. This code shall also regulate 
those mechanical systems, system 
components, equipment and 
appliances specifically addressed 
herein. The installation of fuel gas 
distribution piping and equipment, fuel 
gas-fired appliances and fuel gas-fired 
appliance venting systems shall be 
regulated by the International Fuel Gas 
Code.

Exception: Detached one- and two-
family dwellings and townhouses not 
more than three stories above grade 
plane in height with a separate means 
of egress and their accessory 
structures not more than three stories 
above grade plane in height shall 
comply with this code or the Michigan 
Residential Code. 

Michigan Part 9A Mechanical Code 
Rules rescinds Rule R 408.30902a and 
invokes the wording of the 2021 IMC 
with the exception that it refers to the 
Michigan Residential Code instead of 
the International Residential Code. 

16



Section 102 General 
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 

[A] 102.2 Existing installations. 
Except as otherwise provided for in 
this chapter, a provision in this 
code shall not require the removal, 
alteration or abandonment of, nor 
prevent the continued utilization 
and maintenance of, a mechanical 
system lawfully in existence at the 
time of the adoption of this code. 

[A] 102.2 Existing installations. 
Except as otherwise provided for in 
this chapter, a provision in this 
code shall not require the removal, 
alteration or abandonment of, nor 
prevent the continued utilization 
and maintenance of, a mechanical 
system lawfully in existence at the 
time of the adoption of this code.

[A] 102.2.1 Existing buildings. 
Additions, alterations, renovations 
or repairs related to building or 
structural issues shall be regulated 
by the International Existing 
Building Code

 [A] 102.11 Application of 
references. Reference to chapter 
section numbers, or to provisions 
not specifically identified by 
number, shall be construed to refer 
to such chapter, section or 
provision of this code.

Adds reference to existing 
buildings per the 2021 IMC. 

Adds two additional sections 
from the 2021 IMC. 

17



Section 103 Code Compliance Agency
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
[A] 103.1 General. The position of 
mechanical inspector is created. The 
mechanical inspector shall be 
appointed in accordance with 1986 PA 
54, MCL 338.2301 et seq. 
R 408.30904 

[A] 103.3 Deputies. In accordance with 
the prescribed procedures of this 
jurisdiction and with the concurrence of 
the appointing authority, the code 
official shall have the authority to 
appoint a deputy code official, other 
related technical officers, inspectors 
and other employees. Such employees 
shall have powers as delegated by the 
code official. 

[A] 103.4.1 Legal defense. Any suit or 
criminal complaint instituted against any 
officer or employee because of an act 
performed by that officer or employee in 
the lawful discharge of duties and under 
the provisions of this code shall be 
defended by the legal representatives of 
the jurisdiction until the final termination 
of the proceedings. The code official or 
any subordinate shall not be liable for 
costs in an action, suit or proceeding 
that is instituted in pursuance of the 
provisions of this code. 

[A] 103.1 General. The position of 
mechanical inspector is created. The 
mechanical inspector shall be 
appointed in accordance with 1986 PA 
54, MCL 338.2301 et seq. 
R 408.30904 

[A] 103.3 Deputies. In accordance with 
the prescribed procedures of this 
jurisdiction and with the concurrence of 
the appointing authority, the code 
official shall have the authority to 
appoint a deputy code official, other 
related technical officers, inspectors 
and other employees. Such employees 
shall have powers as delegated by the 
code official.

R 408.30901a International mechanical 
code; adoption by reference.
Rule 901a. 
IMC Sections 103.1 to 103.3 not 
adopted. 

R 408.30901a International mechanical 
code; adoption by reference.
Rule 901a 
IMC Sections 103.1 to 103.3 not 
adopted. 

IMC 2021 deletes 103.4.1 Legal defense. 

18



Section 104 Duties and Powers of the Code Official
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
[A] 104.4 Right of entry. Where it is 
necessary to make an inspection to enforce 
the provisions of this code, or where the 
code official has reasonable cause to 
believe that there exists in a building or on 
any premises any conditions or violations of 
this code that make the building or premises 
unsafe, insanitary, dangerous or hazardous, 
the code official shall have the authority to 
enter the building or premises at all 
reasonable times to inspect or to perform 
the duties imposed on the code official by 
this code. If such building or premises is 
occupied, the code official shall present 
credentials to the occupant and request 
entry. If such building or premises is 
unoccupied, the code official shall first 
make a reasonable effort to locate the 
owner, the owner’s authorized agent or 
other person having charge or control of the 
building or premises and request entry. If 
entry is refused, the code official has 
recourse to every remedy provided by law to 
secure entry. 
 Where the code official has 
first obtained a proper inspection warrant or 
other remedy provided by law to secure 
entry, the owner, owner’s authorized agent 
or occupant or person having charge, care 
or control of the building or premises shall 
not fail or neglect, after proper request is 
made as herein provided, to promptly permit 
entry therein by the code official for the 
purpose of inspection and examination 
pursuant to this code. 

[A] 104.4 Right of entry. If a building or 
premises are occupied, the code official 
shall present credentials to the 
occupant and request entry. If a building 
or premises is unoccupied, the code 
official shall first make a reasonable 
effort to locate either the owner, the 
owner’s authorized agent, or another 
person having care or control of the 
building or premises and request entry. If 
entry is refused, the code official has 
recourse to every remedy provided by 
law to secure entry. If a code official 
obtains a proper inspection warrant or 
other remedy provided by law to secure 
entry, the owner, owner’s authorized 
agent or occupant or person having 
charge, care or control of the building or 
premises shall not fail or neglect, after a 
proper request is made as provided in 
this rule, to allow the code official 
prompt entry into the building or 
premises to inspect or examine the 
building or premises pursuant to this 
code. 

R 408.30904a Right of entry.
Rule 904a. Section 104.4 of the code is 
amended

Note: 2015 MMC verbiage is consistent 
with 2021 IMC

19



Section 105 Approval
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 

[A] 105.2 Alternative 
materials, methods, 
equipment and 
appliances. 

[A] 105.2 Alternative 
materials, design and 
methods of construction 
and equipment. 

Minor edit. 

20



Section 106 Permits
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 

[A] 106.1 Where required. A 
contractor licensed under 
1984 PA 192, MCL 338.971 to 
338.988 who desires to erect, 
install, enlarge, alter, repair, 
remove, convert or replace a 
mechanical system, the 
installation of which is 
regulated by this code, or to 
cause such work to be done, 
shall first make application in 
accordance with the 
requirements of the act.

R 408.30906a

[A] 106.1 Where required. An 
owner, owner’s authorized 
agent or contractor who 
desires to erect, install, 
enlarge, alter, repair, remove, 
convert or replace a 
mechanical system, the 
installation of which is 
regulated by this code, or to 
cause such work to be 
performed, shall first make 
application to the code official 
and obtain the required permit 
for the work.
 Exception: Where 
equipment and appliance 
replacements or repairs must 
be performed in an 
emergency, the permit 
application shall be submitted 
within the next working 
business day of the 
department of mechanical 
inspection.

New wording incorporated 
per 2021 IMC. 

21



Section 106 Permits (exceptions) contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
[A] 106.2. Permits not required. A 
person is not required to obtain a permit 
to perform mechanical work on any of 
the following items:
(a) A portable heating or gas appliance 
that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s 
per hour.
(b) Portable ventilation appliances and 
equipment.
(c) A portable cooling unit.
(d) Steam, hot water, or chilled water 
piping within any heating or cooling 
equipment or an appliance regulated by 
the code.
(e) The replacement of any minor part 
that does not alter the approval of 
equipment or make the appliance or 
equipment unsafe.
(f) portable evaporative cooler.
(g) Self-contained refrigeration systems 
that contain 10 pounds or less of 
refrigerant, or that are actuated by 
motors of 1.5 horsepower or less.
(h) Portable fuel cell appliances that are 
not connected to a fixed piping system 
and are not interconnected to a power 
grid.

[A] 106.2. Permits not required. A 
person is not required to obtain a permit 
to perform mechanical work on any of 
the following items:
(a) A portable heating or gas appliance 
that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s 
per hour.
(b) Portable ventilation appliances and 
equipment.
(c) A portable cooling unit.
(d) Steam, hot water, or chilled water 
piping within any heating or cooling 
equipment or appliances regulated by 
the code.
(e) Except for a heat exchanger, 
replacement of any manufacturer 
installed part on a listed and labeled 
appliance or listed and labeled 
equipment, if the replacement does not 
alter the approval of the appliance or 
equipment or make the appliance or 
equipment unsafe.
(f) Self-contained refrigeration systems 
that contain 10 pounds or less of 
refrigerant, or that are actuated by 
motors of 1.5 horsepower or less.
(g) Portable fuel cell appliances that are 
not connected to a fixed piping system 
and are not interconnected to a power 
grid.

Michigan Part 9A Mechanical Code 
Rules R 408.30906a
Clarifies which parts can be replaced on 
a listed and labeled appliance or 
equipment without requiring a permit.
Deletes “(f) portable evaporative cooler” 
since it is included in (c).  
Deletes “(j) A portable gas heater that 
has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per 
hour” since it is included in (a).
Clarifies wording regarding permit 
exemption for the installation of gas 
piping when changing or relocating gas 
meters or regulators.
Identifies the Michigan Health Code Act 
368 of 1978
Reflects current name of the Michigan 
Department of Environment, Great 
Lakes, and Energy. 

22



Section 106 Permits contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
(i) An oil burner that does not require 
connection to a flue, such as an oil stove 
and a heater equipped with a wick.
(j) A portable gas heater that has inputs of 
less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour.
(k) When changing or relocating a gas 
meter or regulator, a permit is not 
required when installing gas piping which 
shall be limited to 10 feet in length and 
not more than 6 fittings.
l) When installing geothermal vertical 
closed loops under the supervision of a 
mechanical contractor licensed
in HVAC as long as the company meets 
both the following:
(1) Has obtained a certificate of 
registration as a well drilling contractor 
pursuant to part 127 of the public
health code.
(2) Has installed the geothermal vertical 
closed loops in accordance with the 
department of environmental quality’s 
best practices regarding geothermal heat 
pump closed loops.
Exemption from the permit requirements 
of this code shall not be deemed to grant 
authorization for work to be done in 
violation of the provisions of this code or 
other laws or ordinances of this 
jurisdiction. 
R 408.30906a 

(h) An oil burner that does not require 
connection to a flue, such as an oil stove 
and a heater equipped with a wick.
(i) Installing gas piping limited to 10 feet in 
length and not more than 6 fittings when 
changing or relocating a gas meter or 
regulator.
(j) When installing geothermal vertical 
closed loops under the supervision of a 
mechanical contractor licensed
in HVAC as long as the company meets 
both the following:
(1) Has obtained a certificate of 
registration as a well drilling contractor 
pursuant to part 127 of the public
health code,1978 PA 368, MCL 333.12701 
to 333.12771.
(2) Has installed the geothermal vertical 
closed loops in accordance with the 
department of environment, Great
Lakes, and energy’s best practices 
regarding geothermal heat pump closed 
loops.
Exemption from the permit requirements 
of this code shall not be deemed to grant 
authorization for work to be done in 
violation of the provisions of this code or 
other laws or ordinances of this 
jurisdiction. 
R 408.30906a 

Michigan Part 9A Mechanical Code Rules 
R 408.30906a
Clarifies which parts can be replaced on 
a listed and labeled appliance or 
equipment without requiring a permit.
Deletes “(f) portable evaporative cooler” 
since it is included in (c).  
Deletes “(j) A portable gas heater that has 
inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour” 
since it is included in (a).
Changes scope of the exception 
(broadening) wording regarding permit 
exemption for the installation of gas 
piping when changing or relocating gas 
meters or regulators.
Identifies the Michigan Health Code Act 
368 of 1978
Reflects current name of the Michigan 
Department of Environment, Great Lakes, 
and Energy. 

23



Section 106 Permits (Permit Application) contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
[A] 106.3 Application for permit. Each 
application for a permit, along with the 
required fee, shall be filed with the code 
official on a form furnished for that 
purpose and shall contain a general 
description of the proposed work and its 
location. The contractor who is 
performing the work shall sign the 
application. The permit application shall 
indicate the proposed occupancy of all 
parts of the building and of that portion 
of the site or lot, if any, not covered by 
the building or structure and shall 
contain such other information required 
by the act.  

[A] 106.3 Application for permit. Each 
application for a permit, with the 
required fee, shall be filed with the code 
official on a form furnished for that 
purpose and shall contain a general 
description of the proposed work and its 
location. The application shall be signed 
by the owner or the owner’s authorized 
agent. The permit application shall 
indicate the proposed occupancy of all 
parts of the building and of that portion 
of the site or lot, if any, not covered by 
the building or structure and shall 
contain such other information required 
by the code official. 

New wording incorporated per 2021 IMC. 

24



Section 106 Permits (Inspection) contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 

106.3.2 Preliminary 
Inspection. Before a 
permit is issued, the code 
official is authorized to 
inspect and evaluate the 
systems, equipment, 
buildings, devices, 
premises and spaces or 
areas to be used. 

106.3.1 Preliminary 
Inspection. Before a 
permit is issued, the code 
official is authorized to 
inspect and evaluate the 
systems, equipment, 
buildings, devices, 
premises and spaces or 
areas to be used. 

Section numbering revised 
to align with 2021 IMC. 

25



Section 106 Permits (Construction Documents) contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
106.3.1 Construction documents. 
(1) Construction documents, 
engineering calculations, diagrams, and 
other data shall be submitted in 2 or 
more sets with each application for a 
permit. The code official shall require 
construction documents, computations, 
and specifications to be prepared and 
designed by a registered design 
professional, licensed in accordance 
with the occupational code, 1980 PA 
299, MCL 339.101 to 339.2919. 
Exceptions:
1. The code official may waive the 
submission of construction documents, 
calculations, or other data if the nature 
of the work applied for is such that 
reviewing of construction documents is 
not necessary to determine compliance 
with the code. 
2. Construction documents shall not be 
required when obtaining a permit from 
the bureau of construction codes for any 
of the following circumstance: 

106.3.1 Construction documents. 
(1) Construction documents, engineering 
calculations, diagrams, and other data 
shall be submitted in 2 or more sets with 
each application for a permit. Code 
officials may require additional 
construction documents at any point 
during construction. The code official 
shall require construction documents, 
computations, and specifications to be 
prepared and designed by a registered 
design professional, licensed in 
accordance with the occupational code, 
1980 PA 299, MCL 339.101 to 339.2677. 
Exceptions:
1. The code official may waive the 
submission of construction documents, 
calculations, or other data if the nature of 
the work applied for is such that reviewing 
of construction documents is not 
necessary to determine compliance with 
the code. 
2. Construction documents shall not be 
required when obtaining a permit from the 
bureau of construction codes for any of 
the following circumstances: 

Michigan Part 9A Mechanical Code 
Rules R 408.30906a:
Authorizes code officials to require 
additional construction documents at 
any point during construction.
Updates references to Occupational 
Code Act 299 of 1980.
Deletes one and 2-family dwellings from 
list of circumstances where 
construction documents shall not be 
required.
Deletes discussion of unusual designs 
and designs “beyond conventional 
system parameters”. The fact that “code 
officials may require additional 
construction documents at any point 
during construction” addresses such 
circumstance.

Note: The version of MMC 2021 posted 
at UpCodes includes this verbiage in 
“Section107.1 Construction 
Documents” under “Section 107 
Temporary Equipment, Systems and 
Usage.” This is consistent with IMC 2021 
“Section107.1 Construction 
Documents” under “Section 107 
Construction Documents”. 

26

https://up.codes/viewer/michigan/imc-2021/chapter/1/scope-and-administration


Section 106 Permits (Construction Documents) contd.
2015 Michigan Mechanical Code 2021 Michigan Mechanical Code Analysis 
(a) One and 2-family dwellings when the 
heating or cooling input rating is 375,00 
Btu’s or less. 
(b) Alterations and repair work determined 
by the mechanical official to be of a minor 
nature. 
(c) Business, mercantile, and storage use 
group buildings having HVAC equipment 
only, with 1 fire area and not more than 
3,500 square feet. 
(d) Work completed by a governmental 
subdivision or state agency costing less 
than $15,000.00. 
Bureau code officials may require 
construction documents in unusual designs 
and where questions arise as a result of 
system design beyond conventional system 
parameters.
(2) Where special conditions exist, the code 
official may require additional construction 
documents to be prepared by a registered 
design professional. 
(3) Construction documents shall be drawn 
to scale and shall be of sufficient clarity to 
indicate the location, nature, and extent of 
the work proposed and show in detail that 
the work conforms to the provisions of this 
code. 
(4) Construction documents for buildings 
more than 2 stories in height shall indicate 
where penetrations will be made for 
mechanical systems, and the materials and 
methods for maintaining required structural 
safety, fire-resistance rating, and fire 
blocking 

b. Business, mercantile, and storage use 
group buildings having HVAC equipment 
only, with 1 fire area and not more than 
3,500 square feet. 
c. Work completed by a governmental 
subdivision or state agency costing less 
than $15,000.00. 
(2) Where special conditions exist, the 
code official may require additional 
construction documents to be prepared 
by a registered design professional. 
(3) Construction documents shall be 
drawn to scale and shall be of sufficient 
clarity to indicate the location, nature, 
and extent of the work proposed and 
show in detail that the work conforms to 
the provisions of this code. 
(4) Construction documents for buildings 
more than 2 stories in height shall 
indicate where penetrations will be made 
for mechanical systems, and the 
materials and methods for maintaining 
required structural safety, fire-resistance 
rating, and fire blocking 

27



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 106 Permits, Continued

28



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 106 Permits, Continued

29



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 107 Temporary Equipment, Systems and Uses

30



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 110 Construction Documents

Section 111 Notice of Appeal 

31



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 112 Service Utilities

32



2021 MMC Significant Changes
Section 115 Violations

33



2021 MMC Significant Changes

34



2021 MMC Significant Changes

Section 307 Condensate Disposal (Continued)

35



2021 MMC Significant Changes

36



2021 MMC Significant Changes

37



2021 MMC Significant Changes

38



2021 MMC Significant Changes

39



2021 MMC Significant Changes

40



2021 MMC Significant Changes

41



2021 MMC Significant Changes

42



2021 MMC Significant Changes

43



2021 MMC Significant Changes

44



2021 MMC Significant Changes

45



2021 MMC Significant Changes

46



2021 MMC Significant Changes

47



2021 MMC Significant Changes

48



2021 MMC Significant Changes

49



2021 MMC Significant Changes

50



2021 MMC Significant Changes

51



2021 MMC Significant Changes

52



2021 MMC Significant Changes

53



2021 MMC Significant Changes

54



2021 MMC Significant Changes

55



2021 MMC Significant Changes

56



2021 MMC Significant Changes

57


